Approved Commissioners Court

SEP 26 2016

• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	ENDA PLACEMENT FORM
Submission Deadline - I u	esday, 12:00 PM before Court Dates
SUBMITTED BY: Ralph McBro	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
TODAY'S DATE: September 15,	2016
<u>DEPARTMENT</u> : Purchasing	
SIGNATURE OF DEPARTMENT	Γ HEAD:
REQUESTED AGENDA DATE:	September 26, 2016
	: Consider and approve renewal of RFB 2014-
418 Road Materials with multiple ve	endors.
PERSON(S) TO PRESENT ITEM	: Ralph McBroom
SUPPORT MATERIAL: See atta	nchment
TIME: 5 min	ACTION ITEM: X
	WORKSHOP:
	CONSENT:
	EXECUTIVE:
STAFF NOTICE:	
COUNTY ATTORNEY:	IT DEPARTMENT:
AUDITOR:	PURCHASING DEPARTMENT:
PERSONNEL:	PUBLIC WORKS:
BUDGET COORDINATOR:	OTHER:
**********This Section to be Co	mpleted by County Judge's Office********
,	ASSIGNED AGENDA DATE:
REQUEST RECEIVED	BY COUNTY JUDGE'S OFFICE
COURT MEMBER APPROVAL	Date

RFB 2014-418: Road Materials

	Ve	Vendor	Ve	Vendor	Ven	Vendor	Vendor	or	Ver	Vendor	Ve	Vendor	Vendor	dor
Vendor	Fort Wor	Fort Worth Crushed Stone	Arnold Cr	Arnold Crushed Stone	Apac-Te	Apac-Texas Inc	Vulcan Materials	terials	Martin	Martin Marietta	Rattle	Rattler Rock	37 M	37 Mining
	Pick up	Pick up Freight	Pick Up	Freight	Pick Up	Freight	Pick Up	Freight	Pick up	Freight	Pick Up	Freight	Pick Up	Freight
Hot Mix (334) Type F	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Chico \$75.00 Alvarado \$90.00	*	\$85.00	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Hot Mix Type AC 1.5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Chico \$75.00 Alvarado \$90.00	*	\$70.00	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HMAC (340) Type B	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Alvarado \$56.00 South FW \$56.00	*	\$63.00	\$0.33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
HMAC (340) Type D	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Alvarado \$58.00 South FW \$58.00	*	\$65.00	\$0.33	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Riprap, Type R 432	\$11.00	No Bid	\$18.00 Tolar	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.00 Chico	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Riprap, Type F 432	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.00 Tolar	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Surf Agg, Type A Grade 4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.00	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Surf Agg, Type A Grade 5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.50	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Surf Agg, Type B Grade 4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$21.00	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Surf Agg, Type B Grade 5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.50	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3/8" Pea Gravel	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.00 Weatherford	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
RB Line Plant Waste with 1/2"	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Weathered Line Kiln Dust	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Concrete Sand	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$11.00	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.00	\$0.25
Prot Type I/II	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$110.00 Midlothian	\$0.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Flexible Base, Item 247 Grade 1	\$4.15 Cresson Plant	No Bid	\$5.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.00	\$0.25	\$8.00 Chico	No Bid	\$5.25	No Bid	\$6.50 Type A	\$0.25
Flexible Base, Item 247 Grade 2	\$5.15 Weatherford Plant	No Bid	\$5.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$10.00	\$0.25	\$8.00 Chico	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.50 Type A	\$0.25
Flexible Base, Item 247 Grade 3	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Coated Rock PB3	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$45.00	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Coated Rock PB4	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$45.00	\$0.25	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
High Performance Cold Mix	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	Chico \$95.00 Alvarado \$110.00	*	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Minimum Order, if Applicable			23	23 Tons	23 Tons for delivery	No Min on FOB	22 Tons	s	25 T	25 Tons	Also have a 3"- \$6.	Also have a 3"-5" over size rock \$6.25-T	24 Tons	suo
Other Fees					*1-10 Miles \$5.00 per ton, add \$0.30 a ton for each additional mile	per ton, add \$0.30 additional mile			\$300.00/Load if a spreader bar is desired on cement deliveries	if a spreader J on cement eries				